LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY

CHILDREN LEGISLATION AMENDMENT BILL 2009

(Amendments to be moved by Ms Neville)

1. Clause 11, after line 13 insert—
‘() Insection 33(1) of the Child Wellbeing and Safety Act 2005, for "3
months" substitute "12 months".".
2. Clause 11, after line 22 insert—

‘() Insection 33(4) of the Child Wellbeing and Safety Act 2005, for "3
months" substitute "12 months".".

561302GA.H-27/7/2009



