
TRE01A 

 

LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY 

RENEWABLE ENERGY (JOBS AND INVESTMENT) AMENDMENT BILL 2019 

  

(Amendments to be moved by Dr Read) 

 

1. Clause 1, line 6, omit "50%" and insert "100%". 

2. Clause 3, line 13, omit "50%" and insert "100%". 

 

AMENDMENT OF LONG TITLE 

3. Long title, omit "50%" and insert "100%". 


