
CC10C 

LEGISLATIVE COUNCIL 

TRANSPORT LEGISLATION MISCELLANEOUS AMENDMENTS BILL 2021 

  

(Amendment and New Clauses to be moved by Dr CUMMING) 

 

1. Clause 2, line 2, omit "32, 38 and 39," and insert "32, 32A, 38 and 39, 44A, 44B, 
44C,". 

NEW CLAUSES 

2. Insert the following New Clause to follow clause 32— 

 '32A Suspension or cancellation of vehicle tester authorisations 

In section 15A(3) of the Road Safety Act 1986, for "3 year period" 
substitute "12 month period".'. 

3. Insert the following New Clauses to follow clause 44— 

 '44A Demerit points option notice 

In section 36(1)(a) of the Road Safety Act 1986, for "3 year period" 
substitute "12 month period". 

 44B Persons whose driver licence or learner permit is suspended or 
cancelled 

In section 41A(1)(b) of the Road Safety Act 1986, for "3 year period" 
substitute "12 month period". 

 44C Driving disqualification notice 

In section 46A(2)(a) of the Road Safety Act 1986, for "3 year period" 
substitute "12 month period".'. 


